
BAARRIER -
DOCUM

 

 

 

 

 

ASSESS

 

 

 

 

 

 

I HAVE
FORMS

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

- FREE R
MENTATION 

The job has 

The ad refle
position will 

The charac
requirement
competence
agency like 

The selectio

The selectio
terms of its i

SING APPLI

I am confid
competitive 

I have asked

I have discu
adjustments

I have given
as appropria

I have ask
requirement

I have taken
taken into a
disability  

E THOUGHT
S OF SELECT

Where the n

There is a r
arrangemen

Where the n

There are s
mobility rest

There is an 

There is a te

The externa

The internal 

Interview an
movement r

RECRUIT

been advert

ects the inher
really be req

cteristics tha
ts. I unders
e that I need
HREOC if I h

on documenta

on criteria fo
inherent requ

ICANTS 

dent that I’v
on merit, tak

d all applican

ussed with a
s to the way i

n their reques
ate  

ed all cand
ts of the role 

n care to ens
account thos

T THROUGH
TION TESTI

nearest parki

ramp or step
nts for people

nearest whee

security doo
trictions 

accessible lif

elephone in t

l signage on

signage is a

nd/or asses
estrictions, in

TMENT C

tised widely a

rent requirem
quired to do

at I am loo
tand what t
 the person 
have to 

ation is avail

cus on what
uirements 

e only shor
king reasona

nts if they req

any applican
n which we’r

sts (if any) pr

didates simil

sure that whe
se matters r

H ACCESS
ING, E.G.: 

ng for people

p-free entran
e to get in  

elchair acces

rs to get th

ft if the interv

the entrance 

 the building

also clear, or 

sment room
ncluding whe

CHECKLI

and in the rig

ments of the 

oking for in
the real sk
in this posit

able in differ

t is really ne

rtlisted out a
ble adjustme

quire any adj

nt who has d
re conducting

roper consid

lar question

en assessing
relevant to 

IBILITY ISS

e with disabi

nce to the b

ssible toilets 

hrough and 

view is not o

that is acces

g is clear to p

r have you m

ms are suita
eelchair acce

ST 

ght places to

job? Am I cl

n applicants
ill set, qual
tion to have. 

rent formats 

eeded for the

applicants w
ent into acco

justments for

disclosed a d
g our proces

eration and s

s about the

g the claims 
merit, and h

SUES FOR 

lity is located

building or if 

are located

I have mad

n the ground

ssible to peo

people with lim

made arrange

able for peo
ess  

attract the b

ear about wh

s are releva
ifications (if 
I can I justif

e position an

with disability
unt  

r the intervie

disability wh
ss  

sought advic

eir ability to

of people w
have not be

THE INTER

d 

not, I have 

e arrangeme

d floor  

ople with disa

mited vision 

ments to esc

ople with vis

best field 

hat the perso

ant to the 
f any), and 
fy this to an

nd can be ju

y where the

ew  

hether they n

ce from other

o meet the 

with disability 
een affected 

RVIEW OR 

made suita

ents for peo

ability 

cort visitors 

sion impairm

on in this 

inherent 
level of 

 external 

ustified in 

ey’re not 

need any 

r sources 

inherent 

I’ve only 
by their 

OTHER 

ble other 

ople with 

ments or 

TEQSA Provider ID: PRV12002 (Australian University) | CRICOS Provider: 00120C



I HAVE CONSIDERED THE KINDS OF ADJUSTMENTS THAT I MIGHT NEED TO MAKE TO 
SELECTION PROCESSES, E.G:  

I have got computer hardware and software that all the applicants can use

My timeframes are flexible to allow people with disability more time where that is reasonable

I have checked with all the applicants about whether they need any particular form of
adjustment

Where I know the nature of a person’s disability, even if they haven’t indicated that they need
any form of adjustment, I have considered the kinds of adjustments that I could make anyway

MAKING THE DECISION 

I have got the right person

I have looked carefully at the claims of all the applicants and considered those claims in
context

I have given the right weight to non-work experience

I am sure that I could justify my decision to anyone who asks me about it

MAKING THE JOB OFFER 

On offering a job to the preferred applicant who has declared a disability, I have asked them
further about the adjustments they require and assessed if these adjustments should be put in
place prior to commencement or on commencement of their new job

Regardless of whether or not the disability is visible, I have asked whether the new staff
member is comfortable for me to speak to their colleagues prior to them starting or do they
want to speak to them? In certain circumstances, it may be appropriate for some colleagues
to be aware of the disability if changes to their working arrangements are necessary to
accommodate the new staff member or in order to be able to respond appropriately in cases
of emergency

PRIOR TO COMMENCEMENT 

I have offered my new staff member the opportunity to visit their new workplace before their
first day.  This can help people with conditions that affect their social interaction, such as
anxiety disorders, or whose confidence has been affected by a long time out of the workforce

If necessary, I have arranged the necessary adjustments to be in place when the new staff
member commences their employment and DOI aware of the software and hardware (if
necessary) that the person will be using

If agreed, I have consulted with my other staff about the new staff member coming on board
and any adjustments that will be made

My staff have been trained or are booked in to do the training in discrimination and disability
awareness
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THE FIRST DAY 

I have discussed the job with my new employee and any further reasonable adjustments they
might require that are not already in place

I have reviewed any reasonable adjustments that have already been agreed on, and any
equipment I am waiting for and discussed this with my new employee

I have asked the new employee to record how the reasonable adjustments are working

I have set regular dates to review all reasonable adjustments

I have asked my new employee to come and talk with me if they are having issues with their
work or their colleagues?

I have asked my new employee if they want to discuss their disability with their colleagues

If advised, all colleagues are aware of my new employee’s disability in relation to any
reasonable adjustments that have been put in place and any accommodations that might
need to make

RESOURCES AVAILABLE 

I know where to go to find out information about managing disability in the workplace

I know what training is available in relation to Disability Confidence

I know who to contact if I require further assistance or advice about my new staff member
who has a disability
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